



# Maryland Grain Bids

This Report is Sponsored By:

**HOSTETTER**  
**GRAIN**  
(610)-932-4484

Reporting Date

May 12, 2020

Cash Bids

Harvest Bids

## Upper Eastern Shore

Grain	Low	High	Average
Corn No. 2	\$3.39	\$3.85	\$3.53
Wheat No. 2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Barley No. 2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Soybeans No. 2	\$7.90	\$8.25	\$8.12

## Upper Eastern Shore

Harvest	Low	High	Average	
Corn No. 2	20-Dec	\$3.40	\$3.55	\$3.45
Wheat No. 2	20-Jul	\$4.47	\$4.52	\$4.51
Barley No. 2	20-Jul	\$2.50	\$2.50	\$2.50
Soybeans No. 2	20-Nov	\$7.79	\$7.89	\$7.83

## Mid Eastern Shore

Grain	Low	High	Average
Corn No. 2	\$3.49	\$3.69	\$3.57
Wheat No. 2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Barley No. 2	\$4.56	\$4.56	\$4.56
Soybeans No. 2	\$7.95	\$8.25	\$8.08

## Mid Eastern Shore

Harvest	Low	High	Average	
Corn No. 2	20-Dec	\$3.36	\$3.55	\$3.45
Wheat No. 2	20-Jul	\$4.47	\$4.56	\$4.49
Barley No. 2	20-Jul	\$2.50	\$2.50	\$2.50
Soybeans No. 2	20-Nov	\$7.84	\$7.94	\$7.88

## Lower Eastern Shore

Grain	Low	High	Average
Corn No. 2	\$3.69	\$3.79	\$3.74
Wheat No. 2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Barley No. 2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Soybeans No. 2	\$8.25	\$8.55	\$8.40

## Lower Eastern Shore

Harvest	Low	High	Average	
Corn No. 2	20-Dec	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Wheat No. 2	20-Jul	\$4.52	\$4.52	\$4.52
Barley No. 2	20-Jul	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Soybeans No. 2	20-Nov	\$7.94	\$8.09	\$8.02

## Central Md

Grain	Low	High	Average
Corn No. 2	\$3.29	\$3.60	\$3.45
Wheat No. 2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Barley No. 2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Soybeans No. 2	\$8.25	\$8.25	\$8.25

## Central Md

Harvest	Low	High	Average	
Corn No. 2	20-Dec	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Wheat No. 2	20-Jul	\$4.77	\$4.77	\$4.77
Barley No. 2	20-Jul	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Soybeans No. 2	20-Nov	\$7.89	\$7.89	\$7.89

## Western Md

Grain	Low	High	Average
Corn No. 2	\$3.60	\$3.70	\$3.63
Wheat No. 2	\$5.29	\$5.70	\$5.43
Barley No. 2	\$3.00	\$3.40	\$3.22
Soybeans No. 2	\$7.85	\$8.25	\$8.05

## Western Md

Harvest	Low	High	Average	
Corn No. 2	20-Dec	\$3.46	\$3.55	\$3.51
Wheat No. 2	20-Jul	\$5.28	\$5.70	\$5.49
Barley No. 2	20-Jul	\$3.25	\$3.25	\$3.25
Soybeans No. 2	20-Nov	\$7.87	\$7.90	\$7.89

## State Average

Grain	Today's	Today's	Today's	Last Week	Compared to	Avg Last	Avg Last
	Low	High	Average				
Corn No. 2	\$3.29	\$3.85	\$3.59	\$3.53	\$0.06	\$3.53	\$4.01
Wheat No. 2	\$3.85	\$5.70	\$5.43	\$5.38	\$0.05	\$5.85	\$5.15
Barley No. 3	\$3.00	\$4.56	\$3.55	\$3.22	\$0.34	\$3.30	\$2.83
Soybeans No. 2	\$7.85	\$8.55	\$8.12	\$7.94	\$0.17	\$7.83	\$7.50

